
Jackson’s Subscriber Revival Sequence 
 

 

Email #1 
 

Sub: It’s been a while (F Name)… Let’s catch up 

Sub: Been a hot minute ( F Name)… what’s up 

Sub: Missed you (F name) 

Sub: Long time no talk (f name) 
 
 
Hey (F Name), 
 
I know… it’s been a hot minute since I last landed in your inbox. 
 
But seriously, I get it life gets busy, inboxes get flooded, and my emails probably 
got lost in the chaos.  
 
Here I am, ready to pick things back up and I’ve got some killer insights to share 
that’ll help you get your oomph back in the bedroom. You know, the kind of stuff 
that’s too spicy for social media. Gotta show some love to those "community 
guidelines" too right? 
 
So F name what say we dust the cobwebs off and dive straight back in. 
 
Here’s a quick tip I think you’ll appreciate:  
(Put a link here) 



 
Just my way of saying thanks for sticking around 
 
Glad to be back, 
 
Jackson 
 
 

 
 

Email #2 
 

Sub: [Real talk] What’s happened to bedroom skills? 

Sub: Every man under 35 has death gripped and porn'd himself 
into erectile dysfunction 

 

Here is a very real story of a woman’s recent sexual encounters. 

She knows she’s gonna sound like an asshole and she was sorry for it. But she 
needed to vent for a second even if it made her sound like a jerk.  

Here it goes. 

I feel like every man between the ages of 18 and 35 I've ever slept with has 
broken his dick somehow. Either he has death grip syndrome and can't come 
during sex with me or he needs me to hold very specific positions and not move 
at all for upwards of 10 minutes or he's absorbed so many weird porn ideas that 
he can't get hard if I'm not wearing a full face of make-up and acting like I'm Riley 
Reid. None of them seem to be able to function with normal, vanilla intimacy. 

 



I thought it was just my ex at first. He could not come during sex. At all. He could 
come when jerking off, but he only came once during sex with me in two years. 
And we had sex once or twice a day most days. To his credit he never ever 
blamed it on me or tried to make me feel bad about it, though I still did. 

 

Guy two could only come if I held my legs up in the air and stayed very still for 
ages. I could not make any noise and if I moved even an inch he'd lose it and not 
be able to come. That was *super* fun and I really loved having to hold a very 
uncomfortable position for ten minutes at a time while the sweat from his 
forehead dripped into my eyes and mouth because that was the only way he'd 
ever orgasm! 

 

Guy three would lose his hard-on if I took longer than two seconds to do 
anything. Switching positions was insanely stressful because I was literally on a 
clock. 

 

Guy four could only keep it up for super fake porny sex. If I dropped the pornstar 
act he'd lose his erection. 

 

And guy five, a hook-up I just finished with, can't come. Again. 

 

I'm sorry, I don't expect men to be mindless automatons who can get it up and 
come on demand. I know sometimes it's just not happening, there's nerves and 
days where you just don't feel it. We're all humans and you can't script sex to be 
perfectly choreographed. That's why when this happens I'm polite and supportive 
and just try to make sure the guy feels comfortable and unjudged. But inside I'm 
just kinda frustrated because it feels like every man under 35 has death gripped 
and porn'd himself into erectile dysfunction. Sorry, I know that's mean. I just 
needed to rant it out somewhere so I don't explode. 

 



Now!! 
When you train your brain to need Hollywood scripts and exact positions then 
obviously the real thing starts to feel like a cheap knock-off. 

It’s not your fault. It’s just where we are. But if you’re tired of treating sex like a 
choreographed performance and actually want to reconnect with natural intimacy, 
there’s a way out. 

I’ve put together some unfiltered, no-BS tips that are way too much for social 
media. If you’re up for it, check out this free guide:  

(Link). 

And remember intimacy doesn’t have to be an Olympic sport or a scene out of a 
video. It can be fun again. It can be real again. 

Let’s bring it back, 

- Jackson 

 

 

 

 

Email #3 
Sub: Still there F. name? Here’s what you might’ve missed… 

Sub: F name not gonna give up so easily on you… 

 

Hey f Name, 

Did you get a chance to check out the last email that I’d sent you? No worries I 
got you.  



You’ve been missing out on some seriously game-changing secrets. I’m talking 
about techniques to make sure your next time isn’t just good, it is 
un-frigging-forgettable. 

After all, that’s the reason you signed up in the first place, right? 

Here’s some of the good stuff you might’ve missed while you were away. This is 
advice I can’t share on social media it’s way too real for that. 

Check it out here: (link).  

Let’s get you back on track. 

Talk soon, 

- Jackson 

 

 

 

Email #4 
Sub: GIFT 

Sub: GIFT for name 

Sub: Thank you for sticking around F. name  

 

Hey F name, 

Since you’re still with me, I figured it’s only fair to make this one enticing. To 
welcome you back, I’m offering you something exclusive, something special, 
something that I can’t share with just anyone. 

Consider it a thank-you for sticking around. (some offer), it’s waiting for you right 
here: (llink). 



Grab it before it’s gone. 

Talk soon, 

Jackson 

 

Email #5  
Sub: Checking in: Your Special Offer 

Hey F name, 

Maybe when you opened my last email and saw “Special Offer”. 

Your mind must’ve been like “Oh great, here we go a-g-a-i-n…”  

“Just another empty promise of giving me real confidence between the sheets …”   

But you know the real confidence in the bedroom doesn’t come from quick fixes 
or empty hype. It comes from taking action to understand and improve how your 
body works. That’s why I’ve put together something just for you backed by real 
strategies to help you own the moment. 

And also see some BIG results ‘down there’. 

Here it is… Just for you (link) 

To better nights ahead, 

Jackson 

 

 

 



Email #6 
Sub: Well, This Is Awkward… But here we are f name 

Sub: One last nudge before we part ways… 

Hey F name 

So, here’s the deal. I promised myself I’d give you one last nudge before we part 
ways for good. And yep, this is that nudge. 

If you’ve made it this far without taking a peek at your special gift that I’ve set 
aside for you… I’m genuinely curious, what’s holding you back? 

Here’s the link, just one more time: (Link) 

After this, you might not hear from me for a while. But I figured… why not give 
you one last shot? 

Your move. 

Talk soon or maybe not, 

Jackson 
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